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Governor sets special session Feb. 27 Letter to Editor 
Declaring there was method in his 

niadness. Gov. Bill Clements last 
week set the special session for Feb. 
27, which will run over the last two 
weeks of the March primary cam­
paigns. 

But the confusion was stabilized a 
bit when a federal appeals court post­
poned court-ordered new elections for 
state district judges. 

Why is it madness? Because in­
stead of campaigning back home, 
legislators will be in Austin voting to 
restructure public school Tmancing 
and Judicial elections. 

Clements knows exactly what he 
is doing. With no place to hide and 
little time to explain, every vote cast 
by lawmakers will be noted by voters 
back' honie. 

No one, not even veteran observ--
ers, is willing to predict how this is 
going to turn out Perhaps the mem­
bership of die Legislature will be al­
tered irreversibly. 
Decade's Realignmendt 

The losers? It's difficult to predict, 
but more Democrats face primary 
challengers than Republicans. As lib­
eral Democrats push conservatives 
and moderates out, the Republicans 
pick up strength in November. 
;• The winners? The ones who vote 
i^ht • the way folks back home want 
them to - liberal or conservative, 
Denxxrat or Republican. 

Few have ever doubted that De­
ments, a lame-duck, had the guts to 

State Capitol 
Highlights 

By Lyndell Williams 

call their hand in such a manner, but he 
was pushed into it by two expensive 
court orders. 

Nevertheless, he must be getting 
some small measure of. satisfaction, 
for not so long ago a handful of state 
senators held his feet to the fire and 
forced a tax hike down his throat. 

It will be interesting to see what 
strategy those senators serve back. 

But beyond court orders and po­
litical gru(^es, Clements has dumped 
all the chips on the table and dealt the 
cards. 

It'̂  the last and biggest installment 
of the rapid voter realignment that has 
occurred in Texas in the 80s. 

Texas will sail into the 90s a true 
two-party state, and we will find out in 
March which party will be steering the 
ship. 
Lewis' Ethics Memo 

House Speaker Gib Lewis drew a 
Republican opponent. Fort Worth 
businessman Edward Gor;, and all 
eyes are watching that race. 

Lewjs sent a memo to House 
members urging them not to be stam­
peded by media pressure overdoing 
legislative ethics as a Campaign issue. 

Grape workshop Friday 

"I strongly support a reasoned, 
balanced approach to ethics reform," 
Lewis said in his memo. "However, 
strengthening the ethics laws is a dif­
ficult assignment which requires a 
meticulous, detailed analysis." 

His opponent intends to use the 
ethics issue against Lewis in the 
campaign. 

Lewis went through this same 
scenario last election, which didn't 
stop him from winning a fourth term 
as speaker. 
Mattox Reverses Stance 

After Attorney General Jim Mat­
tox reversed himself and asked the 5th 
U.S. Circuit Court of Appeals to stay 
a ruling that state district judges in 
nine urban counties run in non-parti­
san elections in May, the court agreed. 

The elections will proceed under 
current state laws. 

Clements, who had earlier asked 
Mattox to seek the stay on behalf of 
the state, blamed Mattox for wasting 
time. 
Republican Camp 

Some regular party Republicans 
are upset with what they see as a dirt 
probe of Clayton Williams by his 
gubernatorial opponent, Kent Hance. 

Hance said he hired Gary 
Maloney, a national party official, to 
investigate Williams' claims that he 
created 100,000 jobs forTexans, and 
that Maloney dug up dirt on his own 
regarding Williams' drinking and 
brawling. 

Williams is sticking to his guns 
about his entrepreneurial boasL The 
other stuff apparently happened in 
younger days. 

Meanwhile, Hance announced 
that former Marine LL Col. Oliver 
North, a key figure in the Iran-Contra 
scandal, will appear at two of his fund-
raising events in February. 
Democratic Camp 

Those interested in the aftermath 
of the workers compensation wars are 
watching the Pasadena-Galveston 
senatorial race, where incumbent 
Chet Brooks is challenged by labor's 
Rep. Lloyd Criss. 

Labor union bosses and trial law­
yers, angered that Brooks broke a 
stalemate against them in the recent 
special session, are apparently deter­
mined to defeat Brooks. 

But Brooks, dean of the Texas 
Senate, is hard on the campaign trail, 
backed by no less than former state 
Sen. Babe Schwartz, a power himself 

Nevertheless, the area is rife with 
oil refineries and other industrial 
plants with high labor union member­
ship. 

For the aficionado, this remains 
the race to watch. 
Other Highlights 

•State Sen. Craig Washington, D-
Houston, will resign his seat Jan. 23, 
the same day he will be sworn in to 
replace the late U.S. Rep. Mickey 
Leland. Clements set Feb. 13 for the 
special election to fill Washington's 
seat. 

•Midland oilman Robert Holt, a 
former part-owner of Ruidoso 
Downs, is reported in line to be the 
next Department of Public Safety 
chairman, which would automatically 
seat him on the Texas Racing Com­
mission. 

This picture was ta l tenby David and Raquel Morales of Commerce, 
California during a recent visK here. The picture shows a few more geese 
flying In and landing on a rice field. 

'Room for a few more' 

By LEROY J. HAJDIK 
County Extension Agent 

An area Dooryard Grape Manage­
ment Workshop will be held in Colo­
rado County on Friday, January 19, 
1990 reports Frank Kolek, Jr., chair­
man of the Colorado County Horticul­
ture Comnuttee. 

The workshop will begin at 9 a.m. 
with some background information in 
the Colorado County Agriculture 
Building located at 316 Spring Street 
in Columbus. Workshop wjU con-

", elude at noon. 
' According to Kolek, this will be a 

basic training program for the 
"hobby" or "dooryard" grape pro-

______ ducer. There will be hands-on training 
during the field portion of the work­
shop so bring your pruning shears. If 
time permits a grape grafting demon­
stration will be presented. 

Dr. George Ray McEachem, well 
' noted Extension Service Horticultur­

ist, will conduct the training. Dr. 
McEachem is nationally known for 
his pecan expertise and also has a 
secondary love for viticulture, com-

y " ^ monly known as growing grapes. His 
N , ^ educational and production knowl­

edge have had a significant impact on 
the development of the grape and 
N̂ ine industry in Texas. 

Crockett and Dorpthy Leyen-

decker, grape enthusiasts with a small 
vineyard, have extended an invitation 
to all interested grape growing enthu­
siasts to participate in the field portion 
of the workshop. The vineyard, Jager-
sheim (hunters home), is located on 
Reese Lane approximately 5 miles 
northeast of Columbus. Leyendecker 
said, "Bring your pruning shears to 
my place and I'll guarantee that you 
will leave with more knowledge about 
grape production and feel more confi­
dent about pruning your own vines. 
My grapes need pruning so what bet­
ter .way to learn other than inviting 
your friends and fellow grape enthusi­
asts to your vineyard to prune some 
vines. We will have a little fellowship 
and share some Rote Mut (red cour­
age) and Jungfrau Milch (maidens 
milk) with you at the conclusion of the 
workshop." 

The workshop will be held regard­
less of the weather according to Ley­
endecker as he has a shed with a south-
em exposure immediately adjacent to 
the last row of the vineyard. 

This program is being sponsored 
by the Colorado-Fayette County Hor­
ticulture Committee in cooperation 
with the local County Extension 
Agents, Texas A&M University and 
the respective County Commission­
ers Court 

Federal income tax update seminar 
A "Federal Income Tax Update" 

seminar will be offered Wednesday, 
February 7 by the Small Business 
Development Center at University of 
Houston-Victoria. 

Focusing on the 1986 Tax Reform 
Act and other tax changes affecting 
small businesses in 1990, the work­
shop will be at 1 p.m. in Room 102 or 
the UH-Victoria/Victoria College 
Library. 

The program fee is $ 10 per person, 
including program materials and re­
freshments. Enrollment is limited to 
75 persons. 

The tax reform act made massive 
changes to the federal income tax 
system, said Rick Renaud, SBDC 
associate director. Since then. Con­
gress has passed three major tax laws 
and several minor ones that affect 
every individual and business organi­
zation in the U.S. 

Registration and more seminar 
information is available by calling the 
SBDC at 512-575-8944 or by writing 
University of Houston-Victoria Small 

Thanks for reading The Headlight 

Development Center, 700 Main Cen­
ter, Suite 102, Victoria, Tx. 77901. 

To the Editor: 
Once again I journey to your col­

umn to voice my gratitude of being 
able to visit your beautiful "big little 
city". My husband David Morales, a 
native son of Eagle Lake, and I were 
there for a short visit right after 
Thanksgiving. We were retuming 
home to California and we stopped 
there to say our hello's and adios' and 
also to malce our yearly purchase of 
that special sausage from Austin's 
store. As usual we were graciously 
greeted with the Soudiem hospitality 
that somehow only Texans have the 
knack for. I met Sonny Austin who 
happened to be there. I had previously 
met Mr. and Mrs. Larry Austin. 

On our way home as we stopped 
along the way at different restaurants 
we asked if the chef would cook a 

portion of sausage for our plate, which 
they did. So we have spread a little bit 
of Austin sausage cheer along the 
way. Some sausage even went all the 
way to Northern Washington. Taken 
there by a couple of truck drivers that 
are our friends. 

While in Eagle Lake, I was able to 
capture the flight of the renowned 
geese so well known from Eagle Lake, 
on camera. What a sight. 

Being subscribers to The Ea^le 
Lake Headlight we will be able to 
read of your encounter of the cold 
kind. We know of the cold and snow 
that all but crippled your city. We 
wish you well and hope the future 
brings rays of sunshine to warm you. 
Happy Holidays. See you next year. 

David and Raquel Morales 
Commerce, California 
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Let's Look Back...' 

24 & 48 Years Ago 

Ybu can't vAti if you don't TOte. And you can't vote it 

you don't register. So pick up a voter registration 

card at your county Vfoter Registrar's office. Or call 

1-800-252-8683. Because when you vote, everyone wins. Every Owg Matter*. 

A reminder f rom Texas Secretary of State George Bayoud. 

(January 6,1966) 
' Four pretty young ladies who will 

be candidates for the honor of being 
named Queen of the 16ih annual Rice 
basketball toumament are Miss Vir­
ginia Clipson, Miss Julia Wells, Miss 
Marcia Kvetqn and Miss Diane Clip-
son... Eagle Lake's longtime and 
most belovedresident passed on to his 
great reward last week with the death 
of Ernest Evald Seaholm, 76, a promi­
nent pioneer rice fanner in the Eagle 
Lake community. Seaholm died De­
cember 31 and funeral services were 
conducted January 1... The First 
National Bank of Eagle Lake contin­
ues to reflect the continued growth 
and progress of the community by 
reporting deposits totaling 
$7,243,377.52 or $628,947.87 more 
than reported last year on December 
31,1964... 

W.H. Harrison was elected the 
new president of the chamber for the 
1966 year, succeeding Albert 
Pustejovsky... Wilcox Minimax has 
selected some fine silver items to be 
awarded on January 8 in conjunction 
with the firm's Silver Anniversary 
celebration... Mrs. Harold Ware and 
sons. Bob, Mike and Jeff and Mrs. 
Mose Thomas and John Thomas flew 
to Miami, Florida December 23 to 
visit with Mrs. Mary Ethel Thomas 
and Mrs. Bill Schneider. Mrs. WSre 
and sons also enjoyed a trip to Nas­
sau... 

Eagle Lake has entered the 1%5 
National Cleanest Town achievement 
award contest The contest one of the 
oldest and only one of its kind in the 
U.S., is sponsored by National Clean 
up-Paint Up-Fix Up Bureau and the 
winner will be named in February... 
Mrs. J.W. Littleton of Garwood was 
75 years oW on December 2o, 1963 
and the event was noted by a coffee 
given by her sisters, Mrs. C.W. 
Jackson and Mrs. A.B. Colbohi in 
Houston... Among the 19 men called 
for draft into the armed services Janu­
ary 4 are Edwin Ehler and Donald 
Wayne Loesch of Rock Island, Louis 
Henry L. Janicek of Garwood, Joe 
Sanchez Luna and Martin Morales of 
Eagle Lake, and Francis Marion 
Wilson of Sheridan. 

(Januaij 13,1»66) 
John David Konvicka and Johnny 

Matthys were chosen by team mem­
bers to crown Miss Diane Clipson as 
Queen of the 1966 Rice basketball 
tournament at the close of the tourna­
ment Satunlay nigJlt... W.F. Meitzen 
Jr. and Johnqy Meitzen, owners of the 
W.F. Meitzen 66 Station and 
Johnny's 66 Station in Eagle Lake, 
announce they have 120 end zone 
seau to the American Football 

League's All-Stars vs. Buffalo Bills 
professional football game in Hous­
ton Saturday. The tickets will be given 
free without charge or purchase re­
quired, to the fu^t 120 children, 60 at 
each sution, on a first-cojn&-first 
serve basis... 

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Baker cele­
brated their golden wedding anniver­
sary at their home in Rock Island last 
Sunday, January 9 with family and 
friends gathering for this special occa­
sion... The Garwood High School 
Band elected Carol Jo Mendell as 
president for the 1965-66 school 
year... Dr. Pepper Co. reports a new 
all time high in its national sales in 
1965, reporting 13 percent over the 
previous year. 

(January 2,1942) 
R.P. Duyka of Wharton, who will" 

manage the new feed store to open in 
the building across the street from the 
Headlight the Renz building, was a 
caller on the staff Monday. Mr. and 
Mrs. Duyka have secured an apart­
ment in the Stiles apartment building 
and expect to make their home in 
Eagle Lake... Afteh completing 27 
months of training in die quarter­
master department at Fort Sam Hous­
ton, San Antonio, T.J. Roberts was 
transferred to the west coast He was 
the first Colorado County boy to enlist 
when Uncle Sam called for young 
men to enlist He is now stationed at 
Stockton, California. He is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. T.M. Roberts and grand­
son of Mrs. August Tipps of Eagle 
Lake... 

Raymond Lee Kohleffel, serving 
as a sailor boy in Uncle Sam's Navy 
and stationed at San Di^o, Calif., 
spent Christmas with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Kohleffel and 
sister, Dorothy, as well as with numer­
ous other relatives and friends... Mr. 
and Mrs. John Davis and daughter, 
Bettie Ann, and Miss Virginia Spalin-
ger were Christmas guests in the 
William Spalinger home... Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Wales and baby of Car-
bondale. 111., surprised their mother, 
Mrs. Kate Ney, with a Yuletide 
visit... Home of Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Tyler of Altair was the scene of a 
happy gathering Christmas Day when 
11 of their 13 childrsn with their 
families came home for die day... 

Alfred Reuther left Monday 
morning for San Antonio, where he 
was accepted in the Army Air 
Corps... Ray Estlinbaum,'̂  Robert 
McMillan and Raymond Waddell are 
among the students leaving Sunday to 
resume school activities at A&I Col­
lege in Kingsville... Among Eagle 
Lake teachers holding positions in 
odier schools and who will be leaving 

this weekend to resume their teaching 
positions are Mrs. Rosanna Howard to 
Shiner, Miss Ruth Johnson to Rosen­
berg, Miss Dicey Wright to Wharton, 
Miss Jessie Wright to Rosenberg, 
Miss Luana Sunderman to Kermit 
Miss Lillian Killough to Refugio and 
Miss Glenna Holloway to Corpus 
Christi. 

(January 9,1942) 
Numerous friends throughout this 

section will leam with regret of pass­
ing of Reinhard Wied Sr., a prominent 
Garwood citizen... The coldest 
weather of the winter has been preva­
lent for more than a week with tem­
peratures ranging from 18 to 26... In 
the hill country which she knew so 
well and loved, Mrs. Coke R. Steven­
son, wife of the governor, was laid to 
final rest... LeRoy Briggs and family 
of Lissie have moved to Eagle Lake 
and are occupying the home of Mrs. 
Ethel Bodle... 

Miss Alyne Wink entertained at 
home Monday evening with a small 
birthday dinner party... Mr. and Mrs. 
Boyd Laughlin of Midland stopped 
off in Eagle Lake for a visit with Dr. 
and Mrs. J.R. Laughlin enroute from a 
wedding trip in New Orleans, La.... 
Miss Ophelia Johnson has accepted a 
position with the First National Bank. 
Her friends will miss her at the office 
of Texas Southeastem Gas Co.... Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Jerrelle, Mr. and Mrs. 
W.C. Leveridge of East Bernard and 
Mr. and Mrs. S.S. Sinclair were dinner 
guests of Mrs. George Gray last Sab-
badi. 

About town. 

•In last week's story announcing 
die publishing of the Cook's Tour» 
cookbook, it read that John Thomas of 
Wildseed Inc. had provided the cover 
for the cookbook and it shoukl have 
read that he provided a negative of the 
bluebonnet that is displayed on the 
front cover.The Headlight apologizes 
for the error. 

The Pink Ladies are selhng diese 
books for $ 10 each and diey are avail­
able at Eagle Lake Community 
Hospiul's Gift Shop, Laker Printing 
and Wik:ox Minimax. 
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Colorado County Courthouse Report 
^ MARRIAGE LICENSE 

APPLICATIONS 
J. Jesus Castillo, 24, and Jo Ann Tor­

res, 19, both of Eagle Lake. 
DIVORCES FILED 

Michelle Saldana and Jesse Saldana. 
Eunice Lea Weishuhn and Iran Tho­

mas Weishuhn. 
COUNTY COURT 

CASES FILED 
' Fcraell Luke, iheft-by-check; filed 1-

9-90. 
DISTRICT COURT 

CASES FILED 
Ben Waligura and Julia Waligura vs. 

Texas Industries, Inc.; Suit on lease. 
Bryan L Johnson and Shirley B. 

Johnson vs. Fleetwood Homes of Texas, 
Inc.; Deceptive Trade. 

Christine Hincs, Individual and as 
next of friend of Kim Hincs and Elaine 
Hines vs. Loretta Rucka Lange and All-
stale Indemnity Co.; Personal injury. 

REAL ESTATE DEEDS 
Deed: Barbel, Inc. lo Barbel Invesl-

mcnls, tract in P. Reels Survey, Eagle 
Lake; filed 1-2-90 

Gift Deed: Elizabeth Anne Shallo lo 
Elizabeth Shatlo Masscy, Trust, und. int. 
in 148.81 acrcs,J.F.SmiihSurvey;filcd 1-
2-90. 

Gift Deed: Mcta Johnston to The A.H. 

Johnston Children's Tnist und. int in 
308.56 acres, Naham Mixon Survey; filed 
1-2-90. i^j. 

Gift Deed: MeU Johnston to J.R. 
Johnston Children's Trust, und. int. in 
295.01 acres, Naham Mixon Survey; fildd 
1-2-90. • 

Gift Deed: Albert H. Johnston to The 
A.M. Johnston Children's Trust und. int. 
in 18J.69 acres, Naham Mixon Survey; 
filed 1-2-90. 

Gift Deed: Joseph R. Johnston to J.R. 
Johnslon Children's Trust, und. int in 
667.1 acres, 1. & G.N.R.R. Co. Survey, 
No. 37; filed 1-2-90. 

Deed: Avis A. Laughlin, el al lo Eagle 
Lake Community Hospital, tract being 
0.9343 acre in P. Reel's Survey, Eagle 
Uke; filed 1-2-90. 

Gift Deed: Sidney G. & Marjorie B. 
RuUa to RobcrlG. and Barry D. Rutu, und. 
int. in pari of original lot 1, in blk. 13, 
Columbus; filed 1-2-90. 

Deed: James R. & MillycenlCranek to 
Leon H.& Lorraine H. Cranelc, und. int in 
106.21 acres, Samuel Kennelly Leigue; 
filed 1-2-90. 

Gift Deed: Hylda Rabel lo Patricia 
Rabcl Ehlcr, ct al und. int. in 380 acres, H. 
Austin League; filed 1-2-90. 

Deed: Gregg A. Homdt, el al to 
WinfredJ.&AdaE.Eben,2.713acrcsand 

easement John Dunlavy Survey; filed 1-
3-90. 

Deed: Wm. E. & Maiy Reynolds to 
Frank & Leona Coxwell, part of lots #15 
through 18, in blk. 4, Rocjc Island; filed 1-
5-90. 

Deed; Costal Banc Savings Assoc, to 
Terrence Sablalura, pan of subdivisional 
lots No. 1 and 2 in blk. 19, Columbus; filed 
1-4-90. 

Deed: American Legion, Columbds, 
Post #383, Inc., to Veterans of Foreign 
Wars, U.S.A., Inc. Und. int in2.901 acres, 
E. Tumlinson League; filed 1-5-90. 

Deed: Madeline EUioU lo Janes D. & 
Marilyn Easlcy, 15 acres, E. Corbitt Sur­
vey; filed 1-5-90. 

Deed: Ida Hegcr to James C. Heger, et 
al, und. inl in blk. 34, pi. lot 1, Weimar; 
•filed 1-5-90. 

Deed: Carol A. & Robert C. Swapper, 
Spur and Spade, Inc. to Ronald G. Ander-
soB, tract no. 9 being 11.788 acres and 
easement S.M. Williams Survey;-filed 1-
5-90. 

OIL, GAS LEASES 
Stephen T. Cochran, ct al to Cobra Oil 

& Gas Corp., 428.45 acres, John Cassady 
Surveŷ  filed 1-4-90. 

Velma Buck,Webb lo J. Charles Hol-
limon, 163.03 acres, I. & G.N.R.R. Sur­
vey, No. 24; filed 1-5-90. Sctiwemms on 'GoodIVIorning Houston' 

Don Nelson, one of the hosts on the 'Good Morning Houston' show on Channel 13, is 
pictured with Janie and Doug Schwemm during the taping of a cooking segment they did 
for today's (January 18) show. 

New members of the Pilot Club as of January 1,1990 
are (l-r): President Lucille Perry, Nelma Strey, Jean-
ette Zajicek, Sherry Thomas and Donna Gertson. 

New members Initiated at the Pilot Club Christmas 
Party were (l-r): Sharon Euers, Ernie Sommerlatte, 
Frances Bock, Carol Mitchell and Sherri Lang. Pic­
tured with the new members Is President Lucille 
Perry. 

Pilot Club initiated new members at Christmas party 
The members of the Pilot Club 

donated 140 f(xxl items to the Depart­
ment of Human Resources to be dis­
tributed to the elderly and disabled 
people ofColorado County during the 
Christmas holidays. Most of these 
people do not have relatives and were 
able to have a very happy Christmas. 

The Pilot Club held their Christ­
mas Party on Friday, December 15, 

1989 at the Sportsman's Catering. 
Pilot members, co-pilots and guests 
enjoyed the spirit of the Christmas 
season. President Lucille Perry pre­
sented a token of appreciation to Janie 
Schwemm for her hospitality and 
delicious meals. She also initiated 
new members Ernie Sommerlatte, 
Frances Bock, Sharon Euers, Sherri 
Lang and Carol Mitchell into the or­

ganization. Each new member was 
asked to light one of the non-burning 
candles on a beautiful candle Christ­
mas tree. Each was presented with 
their certificate of membership by die 
President. 

Jose G. Cano 
completes 
recruit training 

Navy Seaman Recruit Jose G. 
Cano, son of Guadalupe and Maria S. 
Cano of 1111 East A. St, Eagle Lake, 
Tx., has completed recruit training at. 
Recruit Training Command, San Di­
ego. 

During Cano's eight-week train­
ing cycle, he studied general military 
subjects designed to prepare him for 
further academic and on-die-job train­
ing in one of the Navy's ^5 basic 
fields. 

Cano's studies included seaman­
ship, close order drill. Naval history 
and first aid. Personnel who complete 
this course of instruction are eligible 
for three hours of college credit in. 
Physical Education and Hygiene. 

He joined the Navy in September 
1988. 

COMING NEXT WEEK! 

WAL-MART 
Victureland ^Portraif-^tudio 

on our 13-piece portrait package 

~ n PLUS A FREE 8x10! 
1-8x10, 2-5x7s and 10 wallets-
Plus an extra 8x10 FREE! 
on your choice of a tradrtional, nursery, 
spring or fall txickground 

Bishop Charles V. Grahmann 
• appointed to Diocese of Dallas 

Surrounded by priests, religious 
sisters, chancery staff and members of 
the Diocese of Victoria, Bishop Char­
les V. Grahmann announced Decem­
ber 20, his appointiltent to the Diocese 
of Dallas. Pope John Paul 11 has 
named Grahmann coadjutor bishop of 
the Diocese of Dallas. The appoint­
ment was announced December 19 in 
Washington by Archbishop Pio 
Laghi, papal pronuncio. 

At age 75 every bishop is required 
to submit his resignation to the Holy 
Fadier. Next year bishop Thomas 
Tschoepe, present bishop of the Dio­
cese of Dallas will attain that age. In 
anticipation of this time, Tschoepe 
requested that the pope send a coadju­
tor bishop to work with him during the 
next few months and provide continu­
ity in the work of the Church in that 
area when his resignation is accepted. 
As a coadjutor bishop, Grahmann 
automatically has die right of succes­
sion to die see. 

Reading from a prepared state­
ment Bishop Grahmann stated. 
"With tremendous sadness I will be 
requited to give up my ministry as a 
bishop to the people of the Diocese of 
Victoria and continue it in the Diocese 
of Dallas." 

"On May 29, 1982," the bishop 
continued, 'Our Holy Father estab­
lished the Diocese of Victoria and 
named me as die founding bishop. 
With fear and uepidation I embarked 
on this new task. 

"At that time. I humbly stated that 
'1 need die people to walk with me so 

_ that loftether vye may build the king­
dom of peace, justice and love. I can't 
do it alone. I need the priests, religious 

to walk humbly along with me.' " 
As he.reflected on the past seven 

and a half years, die bishop flianked 
the people who were instrumental in 
helping him to carry out his task. 
Referring to the priests of the diocese. 
Bishop Grahmann stated, "I want to 
thank my chief collaborators. The 
new diocese was a new venture for 
them also and I am grateful for die way 
they generously cooperated and 
worked to build the Church, die Body 
of Christ in this area." 

In addition, die bishop expressed 
his gratitude toward the deacons, 
brodiers and religious sisters who 
helped him build the new diocese. He 
also commended the people in die 
parishes for their readiness to work 
toward achieving the goals of die new 
diocese. 

With a deep sense of emotion, the 
bishop also thanked die staff who 
worked closely with him on a daily 
basis in helping him to carry out his 
mission. 

At the press conference, the 
bishop pledged to continue his work 
with die poor started in the Victoria 
Diocese. He also stated that he will 
continue to work widi die Hispanics 
and Black Cadiolics of die Dallas 
diocese just as he did in the Victoria 
Diocese. In addition, he pledged to 
continue his ecumenical work in die 
Diocese of Dallas. 

Bishop Grahmann is scheduled to 
be installed as coadjutor bishop in| 
Dallas on February 21.1990. At pres­
ent a bishop for the Victoria Diocese 
has not been named. 

Grahmann is a native of Hal-
letts ville. 

Mayor Roy D. Van Nort signs a proclamation designating January 20 
as Special Olympics Day. Linda Llpperdt, Special Olympics coach, is 
pictured with the mayor. ' , . , ^ . 

Mayor signs Special Olympics proclamation 
WHEREAS, die Special Olympics is die laigest program of sports 

training and adiletic competition for die mentally challenged in die world; 
and 

WHEREAS, die main purpose for diis special program is to contnbute 
to the physical, social and psychological development of die mentally 
challenged; and 

WHEREAS, participants have come into Eagle Lake from all over 
Area 111 representing various agencies, organizations, and schools, to 
celebrate widi die participants, coaches, parents, and sponsors in die 
signific'ant contributions that die Special Olympics Program has made in 
preparing diese special people for a richer, more productive life. 

NOW, THEREFORE, 1, Roy Dean Van Nort, Mayor of die city of 
Eagle Lake, Texas do hereby proclaim January 20, 1990, as: Special 
Olympics Day in Colqrado County, Texas, and urge each of you to show 
honor and appreciation for diese worthy endeavors by participating in die 
events planned on at the Eagle Lake Middle School Gymnasium. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and have 
caused die Official Seal of die City of Eagle Lake, Texas to be affixed diis 
lldi day of January, 1990. . ^ . . . ... 

Roy D.-Van Nort, Mayor, City of Eagle Lake. Texas 

pk«99«atnnelfM» 
(r»Q.»9.9«) 

Vto vvetcome avwyona. babiM cnttdm odkM orK) lomiiY ( ^ ^ 
rwcanon' Satisfoctkxi guoKsntew^ M i M « » MtadtaK iNMb « M MM* tOiklMMi*! 

- - - iM(tpaeWHMliPMInl iMla*aMM*lnadMi lMdpo( lM^l lMe 
.paf tub)Mt. S2 00 tot each CKldltional paix)n in portioW MInon mutt b* 
accompanied by an adutt 'oppfOKlmate lUei 

StvxJio Hcun. Dail/ 10 a m until one Kxn pna to store dosing, Sundoy (v*tieie open) state 
opening until one tyxn ptia lo stoie clcting 

5 Days Only! 
Wednesday, January 2 4 through Sunday, January 2 t 

SEALY, TX. 
2200 Highway 36 South 

BRING IN ANY LOWER PRICED 
ADVERTISED OFFER AND WE'LL MATCH IT! 

KNIGHTS OF COLUMBUS 

Fish Day 
it's Time For Stocking 

CHANNEL CATRSH, HYBRID BLUE GILL, Fathead minnows. 
Large Mouth Bass, Black Grapple. The Hybrid Blue Gill will reach 

a weight of 2 to 2-1/2 pounds. 
Delh êry Will Be: 

W e d n e s d a y , J a n u a r y 3 1 
At The Following Location: f 

Farmers Cooperative Assoc. 

I-800-643-8439 
Fish Wagon, Inc. 

Route 3, Box 337-C Harrlsburg, Arkansas 72432 

Hallettsville Texas 
Presents 

WILD GAME SUPPER 
Friday, January 19,1990 

All Types Of Wild Game To Be Served 

Door Prizes • Spirit Wagon and M<M^ 
' j $ 5.00 Donation y 

w Texas State Championship 
DOMINO TOURNAMENT 

Sunday January 21, INO 
t 

Inlry F M : $10 00 P»f P«r»on WO 00 »*«r T«om 

Stew Dinner and Food Served During Day 

All Events At K of C Moll - Holletttvll le. TX 
For More Iniormatlon^all (512)798-3311 

HOT PROGRAMS FOR 
COLD WINTER NKHIS. 

'^^%^ • ^ 

V 

RMMM 

MiSOTNUdsWIftl 

When the chill of Old Men Winter storts to get 
under ^ui skin, snuggleiip willi llie hottest ~ 

"Working Grrl" And thot's not oil. There's o 
new nDUuiiyiiiui iwiKvm'f iiwiiiii. nos, 

movies around They're on HBO, noturolly. hilorious comedy speciols, chompionship 

See movies like "Rom Mon," 1 1 ^ % ^ ^ ^"'"9' °"'' '^'^^^^ ^^ 
"Twins,""TheNokedGun: From • • • V B S P'og'Q'nniing^g«'HBOond 
the Files of Police Squodi"ond Wmmm^^ turn the heat up this winter. 

C <M0)!»<»btWin. M •t^«Ma< MOttiiviint«<«••*«<• UNMlBMKkl 

SUBSCRIBE NOW TO 
BASIC CABLE TV 
AMD RECEIVE; 

• 1/2 PRICE INSTAUATION 
• SOS OFF ONE ADDITIONAL OUTIH 
• FIRST INONTN OF REMOn CONTROL SERVKE FRK 

Eagto U k « Cabl« TV 
234-2840 

On*r good to n«w Mbacnbw* m TCH:iet»d 
Not • ! prwnum tarviOM 

onty thnu^ Jwuwy 31. leSO 
m t f M M . 


